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Two curtains ? Cockpit and jump seats? 
On Thu, May 11, 2017 at 9:45 AM Eric Roth < wrote: 

Good morning Jeffrey, 

Attached is our revised proposal which reflects the limited work scope — "Phase l". 

Please note it is "likely" that the material costs will be lower than budgeted and once materials have been selected / finalized, you 
will be issued a credit that will appear on future invoices. 

As always, please do not hesitate to call me with any questions you may have. 

Best Regards, 

Eric 

ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 
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Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, Ncw York 11779 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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