From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: New order for Parts for the JLG Lull 1044C
Date: Thu, 11 May 2017 21:19:44 +0000
Attachments: 2007 Lull Costs - May 11, 2017 .xls

I know again we have no choice but a 44k machine with 45k in parts and repairs in less than 2 years 1s rather
upsetting for lack of care and skill by mechanics...

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace *-'-'_1"
Date: May 11, 2017 at 4:56:46 PM EDT
To: Richard Kahn < =

Ce: Lucas Pascal < =, ann rodriquez “—

-

Subject: Re: New order for Parts for the JLG Lull 1044C

Greetings Rich,
As requested. Please see attached.

On Thu, May 11, 2017 at 3:29 PM, Richard Kahn *—'-* wrote:
if vou think those are the values then sell machine
lucas please be real
daphne please provide total costs to date on this machine
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBEEK Associates Ine

From: sheridon elizee <{ GGG
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Date: May 11, 2017 at 4:16:21 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn < =, Lucas Pascal < =
Ce: ann rodriquez < =, Daphne Wallace < =

Subject: Re: New order for Parts for the JLG Lull 1044C

when the Lull arrived to LSJ it worked for a few months then things started to fall apart on it. They sold it at a
ereat price because it was used and they knew that it was going to break down eventually. we changed all the
hydraulic lines, all the control levers and a lot of other parts | mentioned that it was losing power months ago
and eventually the transmission might go down since we changed everything | needed to change. | know it's an
expensive part for a 2007 lull but once we get the transmission it should work really good since [ already
installed a lot of new parts that was needed

On May 11, 2017, at 4:27 PM, Lucas Pascal ﬂ_ wrote:

This is the 2007 Lull 1044C. We paid 44,500 on 10/05/15 for the machine from the company Machinery
Maintenance. The current value of this machine from the websites Rock and Dirt and Machinery Trade are
536,950 and 545,000 respectively | have attached the links for you to review.

Let me know if you have anymore question

Lucas

From: Richard Kahn < R

Sent: Thursday, May 11, 2017 7:32:24 PM
To: Lucas Pascal

Cc: ann rodriguez; Daphne Wallace; || G

Subject: Re: New order for Parts for the JLG Lull 1044C

these number are ridiculous

please provide age of JLG, cost, current value, etc

how and why did transmission fail

not sure why we own any equipment as everything is always getting wrecked!!

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
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On May 11, 2017, at 2:31 PM, Lucas Pascal <[} N - ot

Greetings Rich

Here is a new order for Parts for the ILG Lull 1044C Transmission and Engine Mounts. | am requesting
approval to purchase a re-manufactured transmission for JLG Lull 1044C. If we were to buy a new
transmission the price range is between 25K to 40K based on speaking with different vendors. So |
received quotes for re-manufactured transmissions for you to review.

The breakdown new order of ILG Lull is as followed:

A
I received two quotes for the JLG Lull Parts from the companies Caribbean Motoring and United Rentals
here are the details as followed:

United Rentals Estimate #146544652- $11,595.66. | have attached the invoice for you to review.
The items will be available by the Middle of June.The mounts are in stock at this time but transmission
will take some time. Items will begin shipping from Texas between (06-16-17- 06/20/17).

Caribbean Motoring Estimate #1011- $9,937.89. | have attached the invoice for you to review.
The items will be available by the End of June. Per vendor mounts are available now. If ordered from this
company they have asked to send the old transmission core back to them.

B.
United Rentals. ETA (Mid of June) Per my discussion with vendor.

Caribbean Motoring. ETA (End of June) Per my discussion with vendor

C.
United Rentals. Item will begin shipping in the Middle of June between the dates (06/16/17 to 06/20/17)
then 3-7 days to reach to Tropical Shipping per vendor.

Carribean Motoring. ltems will be shipping at the End of June. Charles will transport the part to Tropical
Shipping.

D.
United Rentals. Once parts are received in the Middle of June. Items will begin to ship between the days
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06/16/17 to 06/20/17. When parts begin to ship it will take 3-7 days to reach to Tropical Shipping. ETA
for parts to STT is between the weeks of between weeks July 02,2017 to July 09,2017.

Caribbean Motoring.Once parts are received at the End of June. Once parts are receive by Charles he
will deliver it to Tropical Shipping. Estimated Arrival on STT be between weeks July 02,2017 to July
09,2017,

E.

United Rentals. We can use either a credit card or send a wire. | will have to provide wire instruction
for vendor sometime tomorrow since the parts manger is out today. There will be an extra charge for
them to ship directly to Tropical Shipping but | haven't been able to get a straight answer on the shipping
charges the but the range is between 5500 to $750. Can only provide definite answer once parts are
weighed.

Caribbean Motoring. We can use either a credit card or send a wire for this order. (no additional fees
added). The wire instructions is attached for you to review.

F.

United Rentals. | wasn't able to negotiate this price down on these parts the price given is fixed from ILG
Dealer.

Caribbean Motoring. Vendor provided us the best price available for these parts.

Recommendations

My recommendations is go with Caribbean Motoring based on the cheaper price even though we have
to wait til the End of June. The time frames are similar to the other vendor at a cheaper price.

Regards,

Lucas

<Estimate_1011 from_Caribbean_Motoring.pdf=<United Rental Estimate.pdf=<Wire Transfer
Instructions Caribeean Motoring.docx:

EFTA01046028



