
From: David Mitchell
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Wed, 30 May 2018 19:27:43 +0000 

TCO all paperwork is in at expeditor as of an hour ago 

82 sent out second contract on floor 3 at $5.1 , 

Sculptures speaking with him tomorrow 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 

On May 30, 2018, at 3:21 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

no surprise , what about hotel TCO. ?? sculptures.. 82? 

On Wed, May 30, 2018 at 3:07 PM David Mitchell c 
Can I update you in the early morning 
Buyer of Southampton has to move closing to June 22 
Increased his deposit and is Time of the Essence 

wrote: 

I don't have another buyer and if I take his existing deposit and put it out in market could be an issue with the 
mortgage 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
U A 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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