From: [
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re: School fees
Date: Mon, 08 May 2017 20:46:03 0000

jeffrey I will be forever grateful, I am very aware that you could have stopped being so generous to me and
taking care of my life and my health a long time ago, and you never did ... I love you with all of my heart and [
can't wail to see you next time you are here and I am finished!!!

Sent from my 1Phone

On May 8, 2017, at 8:51 AM, Bella Klein <|| | N -  otc:

Sue,
Eill attached,
Please confirm amount to pay. Want to make sure that we pay health insurance charges.

<Sue Printable Bill.pdf=

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:

On May 8, 2017, at 8:41 AM, Richard Kahn <[ - ' otc:

please pay this am
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

te! [N
fax [
cell I
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Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Subject: Fwd: School fees
Date: May 8, 2017 at 8:38:24 AM EDT

To: Richard Kahn </ - I,

of cousre

—————————— Forwarded message ——————
From:
Date: Mon, May 8, 2017 at 8:35 AM
Subject: School fees

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@ gmail. com>

I've waited until the last moment because | hate to ask... == == but | haven't paid my school fees , but if
don't pay them | won't get my diploma, rich has the invoice because it went automatically to him from the

school system. It is around 14 k . I'm so sorry to be asking :(

Sent from my iPhone

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
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JEE
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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