
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn • 

Subject: Re: Monetary issues 
Date: Fri, 16 Jun 2017 11:17:48 +0000 

10 and no 

On Fri, Jun 16, 2017 at 5:17 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
What amount should I send. Is this in addition to 125k or deducted from. Please advise. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
Tel 
Fax 
Cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Joscha Bach
Date: June 15, 2017 at 8:49:33 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Monetary issues 

Dear Rich, 

My account data is still the same; it would be extremely helpful to have something in there right now to take 
care of rent and health insurance. 

Thank you and bests, 

Joscha 

On Jun 15, 2017, at 15:29, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

ok 

 Forwarded message 

From: Joscha Bach

Date: Thu, Jun 15, 2017 at 3:26 PM 
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Subject: Re: Monetary issues 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>, Richard Kahn 

Dear Jeffrey, 

Does this mean that the H+ salary has increased and it is ok with Ben? 

Also, would it be possible to put a small amount into my account right now, so I can pay the next rent? 
(Humanity Plus' single freelance employee usually takes long to respond.) 

Thank you so much and bests, 

Joscha 

Dear Richard, 

The wiring instructions should still be the same but I will inquire. 

Bests, 

Joscha 

On Jun 15, 2017, at 14:29, Richard Kahn wrote: 

i have approval to fund 125,000 from enhanced education to humanity + 

please confirm ok and wire will be sent by the end of next week 
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additionally please update wiring instructions for humanity + if they have changed 

thanks 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

New York, NY 10022 

tel 

fax 

cell 

 Forwarded message 

From: Joscha Bach

Date: Mon, Jun 12, 2017 at 11:33 AM 

Subject: Monetary issues 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Dear Jeffrey, 

I hope your time at the Science of Consciousness was as enjoyable as mine! 

We are currently out of funds again. Until the end of the year, we will need —80000 USD for living 
expenses and rent, and 14000 for health insurance. Could you please help with that? 
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Also, tuition fees for the German school (14,280 total) will be due in Juli. 

The lawyers offered to handle the green card case for —10000 USD. Can I give them the go-ahead? (It is 
probably best to do it via Humanity Plus and use fund they still have in their account for me, right?) 

Thank you so much! 

— Joscha 

PS Your eye contact hypothesis is very interesting. I suspect that what is going on might not be related to 
sight, but to attention. There may be a special brain circuit that forms a feedback loop with another 
person, so you don't just read their expression, but check their expression change upon them reading 
you. In other words, eye contact is possibly not about looking, but communication. (Once that circuit is 
trained well, one can also infer a lot more by looking at the eye region than I can see in it.) 
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