From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn Hx—-“-*
Subject: Re: G550 sn 5173
Date: Wed, 26 Apr 2017 22:07:02 +0000

I
On Wed, Apr 26, 2017 at 6:04 PM, Richard Kahn *f_ wrote:

eric just called
can 1 call you?

Eichard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

On Apr 26, 2017, at 5:42 PM, Eric Roth ~'~_> wrote:

Best Regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT
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2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779
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From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, April 25, 2017 12:30 PM

To: Eric Roth < SN vict <M Richard Kahn <

Subject: Re: G550 sn 5173

please copy larry and rich on all emails

On Tue, Apr 25, 2017 at 12:13 PM. Eric Roth - wrote:

Date: 4.24 17

Client: JE

Aircraft: G550

Serial Mumber: 5173

200 Cockpit Area Price

201 Coekpit Headlinar g 3, TB7.00
202 Windew Line b 3,204 00
203 Upper Side Wall Panals 3 3.256.00
204 Lower Side Wall Panals 3 5,713.00
205 Glareshiakd b 2,133.50
206 Bulkhead Panels 3 3,058.00
207 Center padastal 3 1.074.00
208 Crew Seals 3 11,230.00
209 Contrel column bools 3 1.459.50
210 Jepp storaga 2 82400
211 Crew privacy curiain 3 2,022.00
225 Floor Covering [Cockpit) 3 4.419.00
230 Cockpit Paint / Touch up 3 1,473.00
300 Entrance Area Price

301 Headliner Panals 3 262000
304  Adrstair Treatment 3 4.580.00
311 Fwd Lavatory Upper Sidewall Panal g 1,008.00
314 R/H Fwd Lav Polty Seat -] 2,533.00
320 Jumpseat 3 842500
325 Floor Covering (Entryway) 3 1,272.00
400 Main Cabin Area Price

401 Headliner Panals 3 9.825.00
402 R/H & L/H P3U / Valance Panels 3 13,535.00
406 Window Line Panals 3 13,915.00
409 Lower Side Panelz E] 14,730.00
412 Fwid Cabin Bulkheads 3 3.973.00
416 Aft Cabin Bulkheads 3 3.973.00
420 Cabin Single Seals (8} g 116,800.00
422 Divan(s) -2- b 49,190.00
423 Divan End Arm Cabinets 3 4.392.00
425 Floor Covering 3 3B.235.00
500 Galley Area Price

501 Headliner Panals 3 1.897.00
525 Floor Covering (Galley) % 63600
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600 Aft Lavatory Area Price

601 Heaadliner Panals 3 1.897.00
B0E Polly Seat & Shroud 3 3.794.00
611 Aft Lavatory R/H Closet 3 4,580.00
612 Aft Lavatory L/'H Closet 3 4 .580.00
625 Floor Covering (Aft Lavalory) 2 84800
700 Aft Baggage Area Price

701 Recover Panals 3 11,605.00
703 Baggage Door Vinyl Flap 3 T37.00
725 Floor Covering 3 3. 772.00
730 Paint/ Touch Up 3 3,505.00

800 Miscellaneous Price

801 Remove Interior /[ Inc. Ingpaction 3 14,500.00
802 Install Interior / Datail in Alrcraft 3 33,050.00
803 Fire Blocking {jJump, 3 materials In main) 3 50,820.00
B804 ‘Vertical / Composite Burn Cert 3 7.566.00
807 Maintenance Bunner(s) 3 2,134.00
828 Engineenng / Certificate 3 1,700.00
836 Exterior Paint - ballast for paint 3 5,020.00

§  485.460.00

800 Miscellaneous Price

801 Remove Interior / Inc. Inspaction 11,850.00

802  Install Interior / Deatail in Adrcraft 43,653.00

808 Install Placards 6,860.00

:
3
806 Woodwork (all plus finish) 3 3T3.267.00
3
-]

Hangar Rant 25,000.00

$ 460,630.00

Mods Prica

317 Forward Crew Galley 5,267.00

402 R/H & L/H P3U / Valance Panels - closeout 5.425.00

406 Window Line Panels 7.789.00

407 R/H & L/H Drinkrail / Ledgas 3.572.00

410 Side Wall Tables (rare earth mag, supports) 19,865.00

417 At Cabin Curtain {acoustic, track, magneis) 9,050.00

424 Credenza 14.975.00

427 Aft LIH Cleset (new cabin) 22.340.00

503 Afl LIH Galley 21.,080.00

B02 L/H PSU J Valance Panel (mirror, hinged) 6,115.00

G058 Afl Lavatory Vanity 13.860.00

G066  Potly Seat & Shroud (split, cavity) 5.480.00

511 Afl Lavalory R/H Closet (lollet paper) 2,071.00

814 10 VAC Qutlets (fwd crew galley) 3,761.00

815 Lighting System 6,740.00

$
$
g
$
§
3
3
63
402 Af RB/H Galley & 1541000
$
g
$
§
3
3
63
63

828 Engineenng / Certification / structural & elecl. 55.,490.00

$ 251.310.00
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Options 1 Bid Price
805 hetal Plating 3 56,470.00
Options 2 Bid Price
405 Inner Windaw Shades 3 38,640.00
Options 3 Bid Price
813 USB Ports ) 10,840.00
Options 4 Bid Price
420 Cabin Single Seals 3 27.610.00

Best Regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT
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2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, April 25, 2017 10:34 AM

To: Eric Roth <N

Subject: Re: G550 sn 5173

7777
On Tue, Apr 25, 2017 at 10:07 AM Eric Roth <] - v rotc:
Jeff,
Do you know what the estimated cost is to upgrade his Airshow 4000 to Bevision 27
What about the cost to direct wire an HDMI cable from Airshow to the TV so he has hi-def airshow?
If you need any specific info on the aircraft, let me know asap.

Thank you!

Best Regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT

r I I | I, intlictcom

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779

EFTA01048005



please note

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If vou have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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