From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Radical
Date: Fri, 01 Jun 2018 19:02:00 +0000
Attachments: 201724 LSJ & GSJ pdf; GS] & LSIPDF; RADYCA Wire instructions.pdf

1 forgot to mention earlier they are requested signature of contract (in addition to 66k) which 1 will ignore. ..

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
tel

fa

ce

Begin forwarded message:

From: Melina Brito *:_:*

Subject: RE:

Date: May 31, 2018 at 5:30:41 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn < >
Cc:

Richard,

I'm resending the statement and the contract. Can you please return the contract signed and advise when we can expect
the payment.

Cordially,

Melina Brito
Office Manager

L .

1d=0B0ftZXiu APTRENONmM
IWMDZINTA&export=down

1450 Brickell Ave.

Suite 2120

\I‘ FL 33131
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From: Melina Brito [mailto: || | G

Sent: Wednesday, May 16, 2018 2:47 PM

To: Richard Kahn' < >

Subject: RE:
Dear Richard,

I hope this email finds you well. You can find attached the updated Statement (as today). Also, I'm attaching the contract
agreement for your or Mr. Epstein Signature if you can kindly send it back to me.
Please remit payment at your earliest convenience.

Cordially,

Melina Brito
Office Manager

.

id=0BOftZXiu APTRENONm
IWMDZINTA&export=down

1 1
1450 Brickell Ave.
sSunte 2120

Bliami Fl. 33131

From: Richard Kahn [mailto

Sent: Wednesday, February 07, 2018 1:15 PM

To: Melina Brito <>
ce: Ramon Alonso < >

Subject: Re:

oreal
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

EFTA01048271



New York, NY 10022
te

fa

ce

On Feb 7, 2018, at 1:06 PM, Melina Brito <] - +rote:
We received the wire, I will send vou the paid invoices shortly.

Thank you,

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 7, 2018, at 10:59 AM, Richard Kahn f-'-'_i'* wrote:

recelved
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fa
. 11

On Feb 7, 2018, at 10:41 AM, Melina Brito <]} G- v rote:

Will do.
Please see reviewed invoices and contract.

Best,

Melina Brito

Office Manager
S
1d=0B0ftZXiu APTRENONmM
IWMDZINTA&export=down
1450 Brickell Ave.

Sunte 2190
Mlranmu Fl. 353131
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From: Richard Kahn [mailto | | | G
Sent: Wednesday, February 07, 2018 10:15 AM

To: Raman Alonse <[ G-

Cc: Melina Brito <[ G-

Subject: Re:

thank you
additionally can you please review invoices as they all should be LSJE LLC not JEGE LLC
thanks and please confirm wire of 150,000 which should hit your account by 12pm today

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Y or 2

On Feb 7, 2018, at 10:12 AM, Ramon Alonso ~_ wrote:

Melina, the contract you sent Richard is missing pages. Please
resend the correct one.

Ramon Alonso
“https://docs.goo

com/uc”?

On Feb 7, 2018, at 10:05 AM, Melina Brito

< > \vrote:

Dear Richard,

Please find attached contract and invoices.
Don't hesitate to contact me if you have any guestions.

Best,

Melina Brito
Office Manager

EFTA01048273



L
id=0BOfiZXiu APTRENONmM
IWMDZINTA&export=down

1450 Brickell Ave.

Sunte 2140

o B ]

From: Ramon Alonso [mailto: | GG

Sent: Tuesday, February 06, 2018 8:22 PM
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Ce: Richard Kahn </ - E

Subject: Re:

Will do; Melina will send all the information to Richard.

Thank you very much for coming yesterday and hope to see vou again soon.

Regards,

Ramon Alonso

L.

1d=0BOfiZXiu APTRENONm
I WMDZINTA&export=down

1

On Feb 6, 2018, at 5:51 PM, jeffrey E.
<jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

please send rich the bill and the contract

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

EFTA01048274



and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation( gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

<GSJ & LSJ .pdf>

<Inv 207.pdf>

<Inv 250.pdf>

<lnv 251.pdf>

<RADYCA Wire instructions.pdf>

=GS) & LS pdf=<Inv 207 pdf=<Inv 250.pdf=<Inv 251.pdf=
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