From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Larry <| | N
Subject: Re: HAPP Proposal N415LM G550 SN 5173
Date: Fri, 21 Apr 2017 21:48:39 +0000

YEs

On Fri, Apr 21, 2017 at 5:21 PM, Larry &—'—'-* wrote:

Jeffrey

I'd like to sign up for HAPP on the G550..

I have noticed intermittent #3 IRS box "Inertial Reference System" fail light coming on., [ think a failure is
eminent

List price for exchange IRS Laser V Micro 564,394

[ have 3 independent IRS system in the G550,. And the #3 unit that 1s failing 1s the triple backup unit.,

If I sign up after this unit fails,. I'll only receive a 20% discount for an exchange unit, and stll pay full price for
the HAPP program,

S0 1 would like to sign up asap before | request a claim.

I shopped for the best price,.
HoneyWell direct price was $51,600
List Price $45,600

Corporate Rotable quoted me $47 880
Standard Aero quoted $38,760.00

Do you approve of Standard Aero HAPP annual $38,760.00 ?

See attached contract.

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Gerlitz, Jennifer" <

Date: April 21, 2017 at 3:54:09 PM EDT

Ce: "Spring, Joseph" <
<] -]

Subject: HAPP Proposal N415LM G550 SN 5173

=, "Milum, Don"

Hello Larry and Happy Friday,

Attached 15 the requested HAPP quote for N415LM based on approx. 300 annual flight hours.

Honeywell List $45,600.00
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Less 54 Discount — Savings 56,840.00

= Your cost 338 760,010

Please note: For HAPP, please confirm which DUs you have? If you have the obsolete DU1310, then [ can
re-quote with the Extended DU coverage.

We have priced out MPP for you as well.  They are separate contracts, vou can chose one or the other. Or
both.

Honeywell List $33,600.00
Less 84 Discount — Savings 83,360.00

= Your cost $30 240.00

Let me know if you have any questions. Thank you letting Standard Aero quote your contracts.

Jennifer

Jennifer Gerlitz

Team Lead — Total Aircraft Spares
StandardAero

6710 N. Scottsdale Road, Suite [JJj
Scottzdale, AZ 85253

USA

Office: +/

Mobile: - |

Aoc: + N
I

www standardaero.com

"The trusted service partner”

Disclaimer:
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This email, induding atlachments, is confidential and intended solaly for the use of the individuaks) o whom it i addressed. If you are nat the inbended recipien, be advised that you have received
this email in ermar and thal any use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of tis email is sticlly prahibited. If yaw have recened this email n eror, please conlact the sender and then delete

it fram your system. Although this email and any altachments ane balieved 1o be fres of any vinses or other defects, i cannol be guaranbeed (o be seours and ermar free s it can be interoapted

amanded, lost ar desiroyed. Standardfere and Verilas Capital acospt no respansibility far any loss ar damage arising in any way Tram ils receipl ar use

please note
The information contained n this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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