From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn _}
Subject: Re: Pete
Date: Fri, 01 Jun 2018 21:53:23 +0000

do it

On Fri, Jun 1, 2018 at 5:52 PM Richard Kahn &_1 wrote:

After both Larry and [ speaking with Pete numerous time regarding employment he only want to be hired as a
salaried employee and not a contractor:
Pete’s current package 1s:

Is the following acceptable to offer:

Salary: 100,000

Health & Dental Insurance: approximate cost 14,500
Vacation: 2 weeks

Bonus: at your discretion Dec 2018

If Pete accepts he will give two weeks notice on Monday and be ready to work for us full ime 2 weeks later..

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fa

ce

On May 27, 2018, at 9:45 AM, jeffrev E. <jeevacation/gmail.com> wrote:

We need to get Pete on board

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. [t is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationie gmail.com, and
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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