
From: Ann Rodriquez
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: LSJ R/O Cisterns: 3 (100k gal.) Cistern 

Date: Mon, 24 Apr 2017 01:04:06 +0000 
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will do 

Ann R. 

On Apr 23, 2017, at 8:46 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

ask michael ross 

 Forwarded message 
From: Ann Rodriquez <1 
Date: Sun, Apr 23, 2017 at 7:06 PM 
Subject: LSJ 12/O Cisterns: 3 (100k gal.) Cistern 
To: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Hey Bossman, 

Danny received a bid for $10,000.00 from Mr. Coren to clean out all three cisterns on LSJ. 

Would you like Mr. Coren to do it? or should our guys do it in house? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Danny Vicars < 
Date: April 23, 2017 at 6:50:48 PM AST 
To: Ann Rodriquez
Subject: Fw: Three cisterns 
Reply-To: Danny Vicars 

On Sunday, April 23, 2017 9:24 AM, corenr ..r > wrote: 

Danny, 
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After looking at the three x 100,000 gal cisterns in maintenance/RO building on LSJ, that you want 
cleaned, we could do them all for $10,000. This is labor only, to clean with power washer. If any 
concrete repairs are required or any recoating is necessary, you can determine that when they've 
been cleaned. We can get started as soon as one of units is empty. 
Thanks, Ed 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPad 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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