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???? 
On Tue, Apr 25, 2017 at 10:07 AM Eric Roth < > wrote: 

Jeff, 

Do you know what the estimated cost is to upgrade his Airshow 4000 to Revision 2? 

What about the cost to direct wire an HDMI cable from Airshow to the TV so he has hi-def airshow? 

If you need any specific info on the aircraft, let me know asap. 

Thank you! 

Best Regards, 

Eric 

ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

Rill Logo - Horizontal-
SMALL 

C I www.intljet.com 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, Ncw York 11779 

EFTA01048565



please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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