From: Melanie Spinella <] | AR -
To: 'jeffrey E.' <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: RE: [External] Re: sublime art invoice
Date: Fri, 21 Apr 2017 18:07:20 +0000

I'll ask, but perhaps we never purchased it — it says open — and if | paid for it, | would have had the wire letter and it is not
on any bank statements

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, April 21, 2017 2:04 PM

To: Melanie Spinella

Subject: [External] Re: sublime art invoice

Does Keon recognize

On Fri, Apr 21, 2017 at 1:08 PM Melanie Spinella <] G - v otc:

[ have no record of paying it in 2014 or 2015

Melanie Spinella | Apollo Management
Owest 57th Street, New York, New York 10019

Executive Assistant to Leon D. Black
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