From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn H_“-n Heather Gray _
Subject: Re:
Date: Mon, 17 Apr 2017 22:08:18 +0000

no just enhanced hammer . we shoudl move ahead

On Mon, Apr 17, 2017 at 5:57 PM, Richard Kahn <|| - o<

This is last [ heard so | have not communicated anything yet to heather. Are we receiving guarantee with
London offer.

Eichard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Phone
Fax

Cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@'gmail.com>
Date: April 14, 2017 at 9:14:27 AM EDT

To: Heather Gray </ A NERER -, Richard Kahn <[ -

leon thinks taking the 100 percent of hammer in london 1s the right thing. [ m unclet if we sell the brazqu
for the guarantee , do we pay commission?  oris 4.5 sale the same as 5 after comminsion and split?
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