
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Brad Wechsler

Subject: Fwd: INVOICE FOR SERVICES 
Date: Tue, 18 Apr 2017 14:31:54 +0000 

Attachments: $ I 0,000,000_STC_Invoice_dated_April_20172o_Leon_Black-1(1).doc 

 Forwarded message 
From: Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, Apr 18, 2017 at 6:21 AM 
Subject: INVOICE FOR SERVICES 
To: Leon Black

Leon , 
Enclosed please find an invoice for the 8865 work, as per our diiscussion. this should cover it. . feel free to 

call me. . I also include in writing joslins ackowledgment ( this time to prevent any " but he said " or " they 
said ") - that the fees are 100 % deductible. -as they have always been.!! . 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@grnail.corn
Sent: Monday, April 17, 2017 6:22 PM 
To: Richard Joslin < > 

so do we agree that a fee for filing the delinquenst 8865s and other docs. would be deductible. ? I, think so . 
just checking with you. 

On Mon, Apr 17, 2017 at 6:24 PM, Richard Joslin < > wrote: 

Yes - falls under this bucket 3) in connection with the determination, collection or refund of any tax 

On Mon, Apr 17, 2017 at 6:13 PM, Richard Joslin < > wrote: 

Income tax planning and fees for services to calculate the income tax are deductible 

please note 
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