
From: Jermaine Ruan 

To: Cecile de Jongh 

Cc: Ann Rodriquez a, Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Denali 

Date: Wed, 12 Apr 2017 22:02:41 +0000 

I got cliff to do an estimate it should be ready by tomorrow. I will get the other two in the morning be I come to 
the office. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Apr 12, 2017, at 4:27 PM, Cecile de Jongh a wrote: 

> We need to file with her insurance not ours. Once we have the police report we will do that. You have her info, 
right? 

> With warm regards, 

> Cecile 

> Sent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone. 

> On Apr 12, 2017, at 3:37 PM, Ann Rodriquez a wrote: 

> yes 

>Ann R. 

>> On Apr 12, 2017, at 3:30 PM, Cecile de Jongh a wrote: 

>> Ok. Get two or three estimates. Does she have insurance? 

» With warm regards, 

» Cecile 

>> Sent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone. 

>> On Apr 12, 2017, at 3:20 PM, Jermaine a wrote: 

» I will get estimates 

>> Original Message 
>> From: Ann Rodriquez [mailto: 
>> Sent: Wednesday, April 12, 2017 3:19 PM 
» To: Jeffrey; Cecile de Jongh 
>> Cc: Jermaine Ruan 
>> Subject: Denali 

>> Hey Bossman & Bosslady, 
>> 

EFTA01049614



» I had an accident with the Denali this morning. Ms. Olivine pulled out from 
» the corner store while I was driving to Redhook. The police gave her 2 
>> tickets and gave me a reference slip to pick up a Police report for our 
» insurance company 
» 
» Damage: 
>> Fix 2 clips on side bumper and buff out scuff marks 
>> 
>> 
> 
> 
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