
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn • 

Subject: Re: LV ZM House Appliances 
Date: Wed, 05 Apr 2017 21:23:33 +0000 

Ok 
On Wed, Apr 5, 2017 at 11:20 PM Richard Kahn wrote: 

total cost with tax is approximately 6,675 before Brice seeks better pricing from HD 
please advise if ok to proceed 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: LV ZM House Appliances 
Date: April 5, 2017 at 12:21:39 PM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn < 
Cc: Zorro Ranch < 

Rich 

Attached for your review, photo's of existing appliances at LV Zorro House and proposal to for replacement. 
The existing appliances are 17 years old, microwave does not work, oven thermostat is faulty, dishwasher doesn't dry dishes properly 

I will probably get better pricing Easter Weekend. 
Please note Taxes are not included. 

How do you wish to proceed 

Stanley, NM 

Ph: 

please note 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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