
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Peter Fenwick 

Subject: Re: Skype 
Date: Sun, 02 Apr 2017 21:51:25 +0000 

andy? 

On Sun, Apr 2, 2017 at 11:48 PM, Peter Fenwick > wrote: 

Most streamlined. Pay to the Scientific and Medical network, who will distribute the grant to Andy in Cyprus. 

Andy does the work, Joy me and Kevin are collaborators. 

Land line + 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com
Sent: 02 April 2017 21:04 
To: Peter Fenwick • c > 
Subject: Re: Skype 

i see your connection must be terrible. I m looking for a more streamlined solution. then paying unccessary 
people and in the case of goldsmith even one that has argues agaisnt the gift. 

On Sun, Apr 2, 2017 at 9:40 PM, Peter Fenwick < 

Any time between 11 and 4 pm tomorrow any good.(Paris time)? 

please note 
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WE 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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