
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: kraus 
Date: Fri, 31 Mar 2017 16:51:52 +0000 

thx 

On Fri, Mar 31, 2017 at 2:58 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
money sent yesterday via fed ex 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Bella Klein < 
Subject: Re: hi 
Date: March 30, 2017 at 2:14:13 PM EDT 
To: Cynthia Schulze <C nthia.Schulze asu.edu>
Cc: Lawrence Krauss >, Richard Kahn 
Amelia Huggins < 

The attached check will be send by fedex today 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Mar 30, 2017, at 2:06 PM, Cynthia Schulze < 

Bella, 
Thank you for the call to confirm the address. Please use this one for the delivery. 

wrote: 
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ASU Origins Project 
Old Main, 400 E. Tyler Mall 
Suite 105 
Tempe, AZ 85287-1902 

Thank you, 
Cynthia 

Cynthia Schulze 
Business Operations Manager 
Origins Project at ASU, Arizona State University 
M. Box 871902, Tempe, AZ 85287.1902 

origins.asu.edu I facebook.com/ASUOriginsProject I twitter.com/ASUOrigins

From: Cynthia <cynthia.schulze@asu.edu>
Date: Thursday, March 30, 2017 at 9:57 AM 
To: Lawrence Krauss ca>, Richard Kahn 
Cc: Bella Klein a, Amelia Huggins 
Subject: Re: hi 

Hello Richard, 
Thank you for asking, yes you are correct to make payment to the "ASU Foundation" and include reference to Origins 
Project and account St 30004641. We appreciate very much the support from Mr. Epstein and your facilitating it. Checks 
can be mailed to our address below or if you prefer to wire payment please let me know and I will provide you this 
information. 

Kindest Regards, 
Cynthia 

Cynthia Schulze 
Business Operations Manager 
Origins Project at ASU, Arizona State University 

Box 871902, Tempe, AZ 85287-1902 

From: Lawrence Krauss 
Date: Thursday, March 30, 2017 at 9:05 AM 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Bella Klein a, Amelia Huggins 

UOriginsProject I twitter.com/ASUOrigins

c M> Cynthia 
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<cynthia.schulze@asu.edu> Lawrence Krauss 
Subject: Re: hi 

thanks.. yes, I believe so, though I am cc'ing my staff who will confirm. 
Lawrence M. Krauss 
Director, The Origins Project at ASU 
Co-Director, Cosmology Initiative 
Foundation Professor 
School of Earth & Space Exploration and Physics Department 

orlains.asu.edu 

On Mar 30, 2017, at 2:16 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

Should I send money to asu foundation as we have done in the past. Please advise thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationPgmail.com>
Date: March 29, 2017 at 10:10:21 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: hi 

send 25k to university 
 Forwarded message 
From: Lawrence Krauss < 
Date: Wed, Mar 29, 2017 at 7:51 PM 
Subject: hi 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmailcom>
Cc: Lawrence Krauss ‹ > 

hi.. things going just great with nancy, btw.. feeling good about that. Just finished crazy 10 days of book promotion.. it 
is doing well. will send you a book.. where? 

Noam is going to stay in Tucson I believe, but visit Tempe from time to time... just fyi 

we picked 2 (Epstein) Origins Undergrad research projects to support this year, at the canonical $10K/per project. I 
don't know how we get money from you for these, but wanted to give 
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you a heads up. 

Our Origins Postdoc Prize winner will be coming next week to lecture (on origin of life) if you want to drop by.. 

Saw Johnny in LA when I was there this week.. he is doing well, and am hoping to pick up Paine again. 

Lawrence M. Krauss 
Director, The Origins Project at ASU 
Co-Director, Cosmology Initiative 
Foundation Professor 
School of Earth & Space Exploration and Physics Department 
Arizona State Universit Box 871404 Tern • e AZ 85287-1404 

origins.asu.edu 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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