From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn Hx—-“-*
Subject: Re: Aircraft Hull & Liability coverage for new G350
Date: Mon, 27 Mar 2017 18:59:22 +0000

250

On Mon, Mar 27, 2017 at 2:58 PM, Richard Kahn fi—'* wrote:

250mm 15 minimum needed for worldwide coverage
total costs for g550:

250mm 33,800
J00mm 35,000
S00mm 44,500

please advise on insurance amount
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Marchfeld, Lee" <

Subject: Aircraft Hull & Liability coverage for new G550
Date: March 27, 2017 at 1:52:28 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn </ -

Rich, here are the annual quotes to add the 2008 Gulfstream G550:
Hull Coverage: $16mil insured value

Hull Rate(including War) .09

Annual Hull Premium $14.400
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Aidrcraft Liability:

$250mil - $18.000
$300mil - $19.000

$500muil - $28.000

Third Party War Liability:

$250mil - $1.400
£300mil - $1.600

$500mul - 52,100

Please call to discuss when you have a chance.

Lea M. Marchfald

Vice President, Aerospaca-Amencas

Willis Towers Watson

Willis of New York, Inc. | 200 Liberty Street | New York, NY 10281

wwwwillistowerswalson.com

For information pertaining to Willis' email confidentiality and monitoring policy, usage restrictions, or for
specific company registration and regulatory status information, please visit http://www.willis. com/email
trailer.aspx

We are now able to offer our clients an encrypted email capability for secure communication purposes. If you
wish to take advantage of this service or learn more about it, please let me know or contact your Client
Advocate for full details. ~W67897
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please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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