
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: John Christenson 
Date: Wed, 15 Mar 2017 22:38:26 +0000 

3500 , and needs brice approval. so we have no cry baby 

On Wed, Mar 15, 2017 at 6:01 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
i will reach out to John tonight or tomorrow am 
i recall you mentioned 3500 per week today (which was originally discussed in 2014 as trial rate - see below) 
i wanted to confirm as previous pay was 3750 
please advise on amount 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn Ica 
Subject: John Christenson 
Date: March 9, 2017 at 10:53:41 AM EST 
To: "Jeffrey E." leevacation@gmail.com>

jon proposed 4,000 per week for his compensation 
in 2014 we paid him 3,750 per week 
please advise if ok and when you would like him to start (i assume LSJ) 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax=
cell 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: John Christensen < 
Subject: Re: 
Date: March 9, 2017 at 6:49:08 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn<a ,

Hi Rich, 

I'm happy to continue at the rate we agreed on 3 years ago. I currently charge more in Abu Dhabi, but this 
includes tedious travel, so the old rate would be OK working for JEE 

For the 3 month trial we can also do my consulting rate which is a bit lower at $4K per week. 

I'm guessing you provide housing in NYC and on the island when there ? 

I travel coach and always find the most economical rates online. 

Thanks 

John 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 8, 2017, at 7:16 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

nice talking yesterday.. 
please think about and propose economics for a 3 month trial period 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: John C 
Subject: Re: Salary 
Date: June 17, 2014 at 2:39:47 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

I am sure you are correct. We talked about quite a few different numbers and my primary concern was just 
to get started with the job and prove that I am the right person for it. 
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Invoice is on the way. First day on the job was June 5th 

Thanks 

John 

On Jun 17, 2014, at 1:46 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

my recollection now is that your 3500 per month = 14k per month and jee said do 15k per month 
that would be 3750 per week 
please advise if this rings a bell and if so please send invoice to me atcontact info below via email 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

On Jun 17, 2014, at 12:52 PM, John C < > wrote: 

Hi Rich 

I found my correspondence with JE 

My initial trial offer was for $4500 per week 

My last email to JE was an offer for the trial period for $3500 per week. 

Everything from there was done verbally with you, so I am not 100% sure where we ended up. I have 
thought $18K per month was what you and I discussed, but it could very well be just $16K, based on JE 
going higher than my last offer to him. 

So, maybe you have some notes to refer back to from your talks with JE 

Thanks 

John 

So, 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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