
From: Richard Kahn

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Duane and Vivian 

Date: Tue, 07 Mar 2017 23:07:49 +0000 

Attachments: zachman_vivian_report_03062017.pdf; zachman_duane_report_03062017.pdf; 
zachman_invoice03062017.pdf; 503-96-7269_-_DUANE_G_ZACHMAN_- 
_Comprehensive_Report_-_2017-03-06.pdf; VIVIAN_J_ZACHMAN_-
Comprehensive_ Report__ - 2017-03-06.pdf 

i was reviewing attached before i called Duane and was concerned about Vivian for 2 items that popped up on 
search: 

b) 2009 lawsuit against former employer for wrongful termination 

shall i still call Duane regarding his compensation package or pass 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 

El 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: 2 checks 
Date: March 6, 2017 at 2:01:01 PM EST 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

tc ) 

Duane and his wife Vivian background checks attached 
shall i forward to Brice and Karen? 
brice mentioned he thought package for both should be 100k plus free room and board.. 
please advise on next steps 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

EFTA01052590



Begin forwarded message: 

From: steve roadruck 
Subject: Re: 2 checks 
Date: March 6, 2017 at 1:20:52 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

I have attached my reports and invoice thank you 

On Mon, Mar 6, 2017 at 10:33 AM, steve roadruck < 
Ok thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 6, 2017, at 9:54 AM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

can you please run on both duane and vivian 
thank you 

Cuckman.tif> 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Steve Roadruck 
Roadruck Investigations 
11250 Old Saint Augustine Road 
Suite 15317 
Jacksonville, Florida 32257 

wrote: 
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