
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: Transfer 
Date: Tue, 21 Feb 2017 17:06:51 +0000 

research grant 

On Tue, Feb 21, 2017 at 6:05 PM, Richard Kahn <1 
consultant? 
if so 1 year agreement? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

On Feb 18, 2017, at 1:35 PM, Jeffrey E. leevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

15k from gratitiude 
 Forwarded message   
From: Peter Fenwick  
Date: Sat, Feb 18, 2017 at 7:33 PM 
Subject: Transfer 
To: "jeffrey E." <jesios@grrtn> 

Hi Jeffrey, 

Great talking this am. 

My account numbers are 

Sort code 

IBAN 

Swift 

Thanks very much indeed so we get started!! 

Best, 

Peter 

> wrote: 

EFTA01053600
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