
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski -11.a> 

Subject: Re: Prebuy 5173 N401HB G550 (March 6th, 2017 input) 

Date: Sun, 19 Feb 2017 16:52:03 +0000 

wait until tues or wed 

On Sun, Feb 19, 2017 at 5:47 PM, Larry Visoski <la> wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Rusty my sales rep for Gulfstream needs Chevrons approval in order to quote the 144month items., 
Since Josh is unaware of this additional request, should we ask Josh for approval or wait? 
(I'd estimate $35k in labor to accomplish these items, my reason to Josh if you think it's appropriate). 
We are installing new interior, accomplishing these 144month interior items makes sense now, since we would 
remove the headLiner and side panels to inspect below emergency exit area for corrosion. 
(We pay labor, chevron pays any repairs required) 

Should I request approval or wait? 

Thx 
Larry 

Larry, 

The new company name is not set up in our system. Please review the 
attachments and fill out and return to me. 

I'll need Chevron's authorization to quote the add'l CMP (authorization 
form) and the new customer account form completed before I can issue the 
RFQs. 

Thanks for your prompt reply. 

Rusty Cramer 

Regional Sales Manager 

Sent from my iPhone 

Sent from my iPhone 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Cramer, Rusty" < 
Date: Februar 19, 2017 at 4:24:42 PM GMT+1 
To: " " Pete Rawson < 
Subject: Re: Prebuy 5173 N401HB G550 (March 6th, 2017 input) 

Larry, 

> 

The new company name is not set up in our system. Please review the attachments 
and fill out and return to me. 

I'll need Chevron's authorization to quote the addl CMP (authorization form) and the 
new customer account form completed before I can issue the RFQs. 

Thanks for your prompt reply. 

Rusty Cramer 

Regional Sales Manager 

South Florida 

From: Larry Visoski JEGE Llc < 
Date: Tuesday, February 14, 2017 at 2:32 PM 
To: Rusty Cramer < >, Pete Rawson <: :> 
Subject: Prebuy 5173 N401HB G550 (March 6th, 2017 input) 

Rusty, 
I'll require two quotes, one for seller and one for buyer responsibility. 
Prebuy work scope: 
I -Premium ARCS $114,000.00 (includes Borescope engine and APU). 
2-Test flight using Chevron Pilots, with a WestField Avionics tech in jumpscat. 
3-144 month items due in 2020 see below codes. 
4-Seller is responsible for payment of due items currently due, up until till May 1st. 
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I'd like to get a formal "custom" PreBuy quote for 5173 to be accomplished in WestField starting March 6th, 2017. 
Chevron the seller is responsible for all due items to be completed up until May 1st to clean up their due list. 

My goal is to request your expertise in determining what additional items to add:„,I want to complete the Premium PreBuy $114k 
plus i want to accomplish the extra I44month items due in 2020 as part of my preBuy. Buyer pays labor, seller pays repair items,. 
144 Month codes due in 2020, this is what i come up with as far as 144 month due items: does this look correct? 
Codes listed in 05.20.00 listed as I44month initial, with 96 month recurring. 
523201 
532110 
532115 
533610 
551014 
552001 
552002 
552005 
552006 
554005 
575601 
575602 
576010 
576005 
576006 
524001 
525002 
532105 
531300 
531305 
533410 
554010 
We as buyers will pay for labor, and seller will pay for repair items you find. 
We as buyer want to accomplish Premium PreBuy that includes some of the 12Month and 36month items that are currently due 
before May 1st, sellers responsibility. 
I don't want to pay for the items twice since seller is responsible for many items currently due now,. That appear on your prebuy 
sheet. 

The following codes are seller responsibility since they are due before May 1st, and are included in your Premium Prebuy work 
scope, so my labor for these items should be deducted from my work scope payment and seller is responsible for these. 
codes: 
237004 
243011 
243012 
256071 
256072 
256073 
256306 
262560 
262561 
262562 
262583 
262584 
262585 
262602 

Please NOTE: 
We the buyer are using the name: 
Plan D, LLC 
6100 Red Hook Quarters B3 
St. Thomas USVI 00802 
The new registration number will be N120IE 

Call me if you have any questions 
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Thank you, 
tarry Visoski 

Sent from my iPad 

Sent from my iPad 
This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may 
contain Personal Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and 
confidential information. Any Personal Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General 
Dynamics and its approved service providers and may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and 
its policies. Contractual restrictions apply to third parties. If you are not an intended recipient, you are hereby 
notified that you have either received this message in error or through interception, and that any review, use, 
distribution, copying or disclosure of this message or its attachments is strictly prohibited and is subject to 
criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express solely the sender's views and not those of 
Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation. If you received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply 
e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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