
From: Richard Kahn < 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <ieevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: proof of payment 

Date: Fri, 18 May 2018 11:14:48 +0000 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Max Kohlenberg 
Subject: RE: proof of payment 
Date: May 18, 2018 at 6:48:28 AM EDT 
To: 'Richard Kahn' < 

Good morning Rich — 

Thanks for sending this information along. If you would, please help me to understand what these payments cover and 
how they fit together with the payments we made at the end of 2017 ($150K Fed and $30K MA) which were based on 
vouchers that showed those payments to be paying the balance of the 2017 estimated tax obligations. I need to 
understand whether the December 2017 payments were indeed applied entirely to 2017 tax obligations and whether 
the amounts now requested reflect additional 2017 obligations, or whether they also cover estimated payments for 
2018 (or some other obligations). 

The federal estimated voucher that was provided to us in December of 2017 showed estimated taxes of about $222,000, 
against which a carryforward credit of $72,000 was applied, leaving the $150,000 balance we paid. If the $150,000 
payment and the $240,000 now requested is all for 2017 federal taxes that would mean that the total 2017 federal taxes 
were about $390,000 (instead of the $222,000 that was estimated). Have I got that right? If I have then can you tell me 
what Noam's 2017 income was? 

Max 

A. Max Kohlenberg 
Howland Evangelista Kohlenberg Burnett, LLP 
One Financial Plaza — Suite 1600 
Providence, Rhode Island 02903 

EFTA01054488



Direct: 
Main: 
Fax: ■ 

This email and any attachments thereto are intended only for use by the addressee(s) named herein and may contain 
legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient of this email, you are hereby 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email, and any attachments thereto, is strictly prohibited. 
If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by return email and permanently delete the 
original and any copy of this message or attachment. Thank you. 

From: Richard Kahn rmailto: 
Sent: Thursday, May 17, 2018 3:08 PM 
To: Max Kohlenberg 
Subject: proof of payment 

max, 

attached is proof of payment. 
if i were you i would make the payment today to them, but you decide.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New Yorlc, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

EFTA01054489


