
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: 

Subject: Re: Cornell - freezing 
Date: Thu, 09 Feb 2017 15:05:23 +0000 

No problem just send me the bill 
On Thu, Feb 9, 2017 at 9:23 AM > wrote: 

Dear Jeffrey, Weill Cornell is going to start asking me for money soon. It's going to be 7000 and something. I 
still have the 5k you gave me so I can put that towards it... but then still over 2 out...OOO 
All has gone well and I will be done tomorrow !!! 

Sent from my iPhone 
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