
From: Richard Kahn 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice 201612-145 
Date: Wed, 11 Jan 2017 17:39:01 +0000 

Attachments: 201612-145,_Haze_Trust.pdf 

please advise if ok to send wire from Haze trust in the amount of 15,000 for giamometti committee certification 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Heather Gray  
Subject: Fwd: Invoice 201612-145 
Date: January 11, 2017 at 12:26:38 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

Hi Rich, 
Will you please let me know when this will be paid so I can tell the Giacometti Committee people? 
Thanks, 
Heather 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Comite 
To: "Heather Gray" 
Cc: "Compta Giacometti 
Subject: Invoice 201612-145 

Dear Heather, 

Our accountant informed me that your invoice has not been paid yet. I am really sorry, but I can't send the 
certificate until we've received the payments. Could I ask you to give me a date for the transaction? 

Thank you very much, 

EFTA01057074



Michele Kieffer 
Comiti Giacometti 
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