From: Ann Rodrniguez x_
To: Rich Kahn <|| -
Ce: Jeffrey <jeevacationf@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: TSG Invoice for Service Rendered
Date: Thu, 29 Dec 2016 18:22:34 +0000
Attachments: Invoice 5020499.116.004 LSJ 90k.pdf
Inline-Images: image001 . jpg

Ann R,

Begin forwarded message:

From: Bob Petersen m_
Date: December 29, 2016 at 1:52:03 PM AST

To: ann rodriquez <
Ce: Rich Murrill <

-

"

= brice gordon <
>, Jonnie Melton <

=, Chip Harris

= Mark Banzin <
Subject: TSG Invoice for Service Rendered

Ann and Brice,

Please see attached invoice for service rendered at the RO plant in October and December. The calibration solutions
were requested by Smiley.

We are working today on a quote for the two requested Profibus repeaters and membranes, etc. We will not include
labor on the quote as it is difficult to estimate site time in advance.

The cost for the Danfoss conversion will be provided separately as it will require some engineering time and our Florida
office has many people out for the holidays.

Best regards,

Bob Petersen

General Manager

TSG Water Resources, USVI Inc.
6501 Red Hook Flaza,

Suite 201

St. Thomas, US Virgin Islands 00802

wiww. tsgwater.com

EFTA01057775



