
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: tree schedule and pricing 
Date: Fri, 30 Dec 2016 19:55:03 +0000 

do you best and order 

On Fri, Dec 30, 2016 at 3:05 PM, Richard Kahn 5 
50 palms all 12-15 feet cleared trunk 
cost $300 per tree (same as we paid thru ingrid in oct 2015) 

> wrote: 

20 will sail 1/6/2017 and be ready for clearing and pickup in stt 1/9/2017 
30 will sail 1/13/2017 and be ready for clearing and pickup in stt 1/17/2017 (1/16 is MLK day) 

i just spoke with chris and he was unsure if the 14 Slyvestrie Palms and 8 Chinese Fans will be ready for 1/6 or 
1/13 
he had reached out to vendor and is awaiting return call - daphne will begin calling as well 
cost is $195 per tree 

please confirm schedule, quantities and pricing is ok to proceed 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 

cel 

On Dec 30, 2016, at 12:30 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

lets order all the chris trees. thanks. 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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