From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>

To: Danny Vicars -
Subject: Re:
Date: Sun, 01 Jan 2017 20:59:19 +0000

if we just buy it outright

On Sun, Jan 1, 2017 at 4:53 PM, Danny Vicars &_ wrote:

777 warranty

On Sunday, January 1, 2017 3:45 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

how much is the genset part?

On Sun, Jan 1, 2017 at 1:09 PM, Danny Vicars <[ - . rot-:

hi boss | knida know ur problem just food for thought missy and me have your back we'll move for you and be
better for everyone

| belive the iron fist with the velt clove best and missy can cook not gourami but some good shit 777
anyways just wanted u to know

thanks danny
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