
From: Richard Kahn
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: LSJ chalkboard 
Date: Thu, 15 Dec 2016 00:34:07 +0000 

Attachments: custinvc1519435.pdf 

please confirm ok to proceed with chalk board for LSJ in the amount of 7,119 to Tropical in FL 
tropical should be another 200-300. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: LSJ GSJ  
Subject: LSJ_CC_PAYMENT_5,824.00_121416 
Date: December 14, 2016 at 1:49:02 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < , Daphne Wallace <a 

Good Afternoon Rich 
JE has approved the purchase of a chalkboard for LSJ 
Balance Due $5,824.00 
Deposit $1,295.00 was paid on my LSJ AMEX 
Please advise which CC you would like the balance due to be paid on. 
Thank you 
Warmest regards 

Sent from my iPhone 
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