
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: accounting invoices 
Date: Tue, 22 Nov 2016 15:02:06 +0000 

Attachments: 20161116155634875.pdf 

attached are accounting invoices from July 2016 - october 2016 totaling 53,975 (prior year was 49,675) 

two items in current period that were not in previous years: 
a) art llc proposal and consulting 2,700 
b) gratitude audit 4,000 

FYI - Leon consulting fees included in 53,975 amounted to 6,850 

please advise if ok to pay 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HFIRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: David Hasson < 
Subject: Invoices 
Date: November 16, 2016 at 4:14:54 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 

Hi Rich, 

I hope this is ok. 

Best, 

D 

David M. Hasson CPA, PFS 
Seckendorf Hasson & Reilly CPA's, LLC 
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