
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: invoice - ion nicola 
Date: Tue, 08 Nov 2016 10:14:54 +0000 

Attachments: invoice_ion_nicola.doc 
Inline-Images: IMG_1122.JPG; IMG_1123.JPG; IMG_1124.JPG; IMG_1126.JPG; IMG_1127.JPG 

Attached is ion invoice for 27 days x 303 per day plus expenses totaling 9,011.35 
Please advise if ok to pay. 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: ion nicola
Date: November 7, 2016 at 9:01:50 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: invoice - ion nicola 

hi rich, 

how are you? i hope you are well 

i am still in Isj.. 

i attached to this e-mail my invoice ($8,181) and some expenses receipts ($830.35) 

so the total would be $9,011.35 

thank you, 

ion 
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