

Copy

Invoice

Law Office of Tonja Haddad, PA
315 SE 7th Street
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301
954.467.1223
[REDACTED]

Invoice Date:	Invoice No.
10/31/2013	706
Terms	Due Date
NET 20 days	11/20/2013

Bill to

Darren Indyke Jeffrey Epstein 575 Lexington Avenue New York 10022, New York 10022
--

Matter Name	Billing Type	Rate
Rothstein/Edwards	Hourly billing	425.00

		Amount
Total hours:		111.00
		33,812.50
Work Hours		
Date	Description	Hours
10/1/2013	Review and respond to multiple communications from client, co-counsels, and opposing counsel. Make and send changes to Pre-Trial stipulation. Read Edwards's Mediation statement.	2.50
10/2/2013	Review and respond to Darren's emails. Review new pleadings and deposition notices filed by Scarola. Draft Mediation Statement.	5.20
10/2/2013	Revise Mediation statement. Research and begin drafting Motion to Strike and for Sanctions.	5.50
10/3/2013	Review and respond to multiple communications from co-counsels and client. Teleconference with Chester Brewer.	1.20
10/7/2013	Teleconferences with Chester, Fred, and Darren. Continue researching Motion to Strike.	2.50
10/8/2013	Teleconference with Chester. Review Brad's documents to prepare for deposition. Send same to co-counsels.	2.00

Work Hours

Date	Description	Hours
10/8/2013	Teleconference with co-counsels.	0.50
10/8/2013	Review deposition designations for trial and draft an objection.	2.50
10/8/2013	Conferennces with Fred and Jack. Review trial court order and deposition designations and send email regarding depositions.	1.50
10/9/2013	Review Scarola's Motion to Overrule Objections. Review multiple emails from Scarola regarding hearings.	1.50
10/9/2013	Review multiple documents from Darren to prepare for Deposition of Brad Edwards.	6.50
10/10/2013	Prepare for and attend deposition of Bradley Edwards.	5.50
10/10/2013	Review all documents and pre-trial stipulation. Execute same and send to opposing counsel.	1.50
10/10/2013	Begin research and response to Motion to Overrule Privilege and Compel answer to Interrogatory.	2.00
10/11/2013	Research and finish drafting opposition to motion to overrule objections.	4.50
10/11/2013	Prepare for and attend Mediation.	3.30
10/13/2013	Review and respond to multiple communications from opposing counsel and co-counsel. Revise Memo of Law in Opposition to Overruling Objections to Interrogatories.	2.75
10/14/2013	Review and respond to multiple communications regarding case. Continue drafting Opposition Motion.	3.50
10/15/2013	Review emails. Review Darren's Comments to Memo of Law and revise same.	1.00
10/16/2013	Review and respond to communications from client and co-counsels. Teleconferences with Darren.	1.50
10/16/2013	Begin researching documents to draft Motion for Clarification regarding in camera review of 5th amendment privilege documents.	2.00
10/17/2013	Review memo from Chester Brewer. Respond to same.	0.20
10/17/2013	Begin drafting Motion for Clarification. Teleconferences with co-counsels.	2.20
10/17/2013	Teleconference with Christopher Knight.	0.50
10/17/2013	Work performed by Law Clerk- 10.2 hours (as reduced by THC) at \$50.00 per hour.	10.20
10/18/2013	Attend Calendar Call. Conference with Chester. Review and respond to multiple communications from Darren and co-counsels.	3.50
10/19/2013	Read newspaper articles and respond to emails.	0.50
10/21/2013	Review memorandum re: Monday's hearing and review emails.	0.30
10/22/2013	Teleconference with Darren, Review emails from co-counsels.	0.75

Work Hours

Date	Description	Hours
	Finalize and send out Motion for Clarification for review.	
10/28/2013	Review Order from Judge Crow. Communications with co-counsels regarding same.	1.00
10/30/2013	Review and respond to Motion re: Fifth Amendment Discovery from Scarola.	0.40
10/31/2013	Hours for work performed by Debra Fein as reduced by THC (see attached time records) 26.5 hours at \$150.00 per hour.	26.50
10/31/2013	Law Clerk work (Preparation of Summary Judgment Motion Exhibits and Review of all discovery responses for names listed by Edwards). 6 hours at \$50.00 per hour (reduced from 9 hours by THC).	6.00
	Total hours:	111.00

Expenses

Date	Description	
10/10/2013	Court Reporter- US Legal	120.00
	Total expenses:	Subtotal 120.00

Amount	33,812.50
Subtotal	33,932.50
Tax	0.00
Total Due	33,932.50