
Quail - RE A/R 

Sincerely, 

6/8/13 1:43 PM 

Dorian G. Atwater 

Area Manager 

Jack B. Henderson Const. Co. 

From: Dorian Atwater 
Sent: Wednesday, May 29, 2013 3:58 PM 
To: 'Zorro Ranch'; Rich Kahn; Darren Indyke 
Cc: Aaron J. Armijo; Susan Sawyer; Jim Eichhorst 
Subject: RE: A/R 

[Quoted text hidden) 

[Quoted text hidden] 

Zorro Ranch <zorro.office mil. m> Sat, Jun 8, 2013 at 1:43 PM 
Draft To: Dorian 
Cc: Rich Kahn < , Darr n In ke < , "Aaron J. Armijo" 

> Susan Sawyer , Jim Eichhorst 

(Quoted text hidden] 
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Gmall - RE: A/R 6/8/13 1:43 PM 

mll
RE: A/R 

Dorian Atwater < 1> Wed, May 29. 2013 at 3:53 PM 
To: Zorro Ranch <zorro.office@gmail.com>, Rich Kahn Darren Ind ke  
Cc: "Aaron J. Armijo" Susan awyer Jim Eichhorst 

Good Afternoon Karen, 

Seems like I'm getting much slower in my elder years and apologize for not getting back with you and thanking 
you for your response on May le. 

Reviewing our A/R, we still have outstanding balances of $9,999.60 going back to Jan. 14, 2013, and a balance 
of $2,329.87 from March 20th, 2013. 

I'm not sure if I need to contact Richard Kahn or not, but I have copied Mr. Kahn with this e-mail. 

I would appreciate any timely response from whomever, and if you or Mr. Kahn are not the right folks, if you 
could let me know who I need to get with? 

The owners are getting very nervous regarding these outstanding payments, along with the time it took to 
collect our previous payments on outstanding invoices. 

Because of continuing late payments, I'm concerned if Henderson Const. is not performing to Zorro's 
expectations, being the reason for very late payments and a follow up conversation with representative/s from 
Zorro would help resolve this situation? 

Thank you for your help Karen and I look forward to a response from Mr. Kahn or Mr. Indyke. 

Have a good evening, 
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Cone - RE: A/R 618113 1:43 PM 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Dorian Atwater <datwater@jbhenderson.com> 
Date: May 29, 2013, 3:53:29 PM MDT 
To: Zorro Ranch <zorro.office@gmail.com>,  Rich Kahn Darren Indyke 
szt 
Cc: "Aaron J. Arrn"o" < 
Eichhorst 
Subject: RE: A/R 

(Quoted text hidden] 

Dorian Atwater < 
To: Zorro Ranch <zorr 

Good Afternoon, 

"Brice Gordon 

ahn 

>, Susan Sawyer *c )1, Jim 

Fri, Jun 7.2013 at 11.18 AM 
ke < 

Jim Eichhorst 
, John Stroud 

I'm not sure who I need to be contacting specifically, but per my e-mail below, a week ago, we've had no 
response, which concerns not only myself but Henderson's owners. 

Based on the time lapse since our last invoice payment, and the date of our last invoice of Jan. 14, 2013, this is 
becoming a most grave situation as too our limited options, as I'm sure Zorro is very familiar with. 

We have been working with Brice on what sounds to be significant work being requested, which we'll need to 
curtail these conversations until such time as these A/R issues are resolved. 

If I can get an immediate response by no later than Monday June 10th, COB, MST, as to your plan to resolve, 
other wise Henderson Const. will need to consider and possibly implement our options regarding these 
outstanding monies. 

Thank you for your time and immediate response in advance. 
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