From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationf@gmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn _}
Subject: Re: PBI Pavers
Date: Tue, 10 Nov 2015 19:22:38 +0000
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On Tue, Nov 10, 2015 at 8:20 PM, Richard Kahn <— wrote:

Janusz confirmed paver job was completed today

Total job cost was 9000

We pave a 5000 deposit

Is it ok to make final payment of 4000 or do you want to view before we pay
Please advise

Eichard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: Janusz Banasiak <[ -

Subject: Pavers
Date: November 10, 2015 at 12:28:25 PM EST
To: Rich Kahn </ -

Hi Rich here they are
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Sent from my iPhone

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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