
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Peter Mahler Search Expenses 
Date: Fri, 13 Sep 2013 19:04:48 +0000 

Attachments: 4482_001.pdf 

Attached are invoices from Peter totaling 6,840.11 
They include only advertising and internal fees for the period May 1 - July 31, 2013 
Darren and I never signed their agreement as we never agreed to these fees and thought they would be 
compensated via their search fee if placement was made 
We paid them non refundable search deposits for NES of 5,000 and Zorro 10,000 that would be credited towards 
search fee of 30% 
Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
I-IBRK Associates Inc. 

Mir 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard < 
Date: September 13, 2013 2:56:08 PM EDT 
To: '
Subject: Open Search Expenses 

Good Afternoon Richard, 

Attached are six search invoices that total $6,840.11. 

They represent out of pocket expenses incurred during the period May 1 through July 31, 2013. 

Please advise as to when we can expect payment. 

Regards, 

Richard Tuchalski 
Accounting Manager 
Mahler Enterprises, Inc. 

From: Admin 
Sent: Friday, September 13, 2013 1:48 PM 
To: Richard 
Subject: Attached Image 
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended solely for the person or 
entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential, privileged and/or proprietary information. 
Any review, dissemination, distribution, copying, printing, or other use of this e-mail by persons or 
entities other than the addressee or his/her authorized agent is prohibited. If you have received this 
e-mail in error, please contact the sender immediately and delete the material from your computer. 
You may notify this individual that you no longer wish to receive any commercial emails from this 
sender by replying to this email or by sending a written request to the postal address listed above. 
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