From: Richard Kahn %—-}
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Tyler
Date: Mon, 10 Feb 2014 15:57:05 +0000
Attachments: inhibitor cocktails.docx; Nat Geo Topics.docx

i have attached correspondence from Tyler and || N

when 1 last presented tvler invoice to you on 1/29 in the amount of $13.411.04 for Dec 2013 and January 2014

and vou said no 1 have not communicated that to tyler
now says he is on hold until he 1s paid
please advise 1f 1 should pay invoice and if so what amount

On Jan 29, 2014, at 5:10 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=> wrote:

no

On Wed, Jan 29, 2014 at 4:58 PM, Richard Kahn <

= owrote:

Attached 1s Tyler Invoice for December 2013 & January 2014 Time and Expenses in the amount of 13.411.04

For reference his previous invoices to date are as follows:

August 2013 9.250.00
September 2013 12,397.77
October 2013 9.050.00
November 2013 6,524.08

Paid to Date: 37.221.85
Total Billed (Aug 2013 - Jan 2014): 50,632.89

Please advise 1f ok to pay

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

tel
fax
cell

From: [ -
Subject: invoice
Date: February 10, 2014 10:50:03 AM EST

To: Richard Kahn < =
Reply-To: <

EFTA01140163



Hi Rich,

Tyler mentioned that his team is on hold until their invoice is resolved. There is a publication that needs to get to Mational
Geographic.

thanks so much for reaching out to him,
cell:
email:

Begin forwarded message:

From: Tyler Shears </ -

Subject: Fwd: nat geo article
Date: February 10, 2014 8:35:58 AM EST
To: Richard Kahn </ -

Touching base on last invoice - have new expenses this month and want to confirm we are OK
Sorry for phone message just landed at airport

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: [ -

Date: February 10, 2014 at 1:07:23 AM EST

To: Tyler Shears f—-“-n jeffrey epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com=

Subject: nat geo article

Reply-To: NN - S

Hi Tyler,

attached is the feature article for ntl. Georgraphic. | highlighted the spots with Jeffrey's name.
attached also are suggested article topics for them.

| also have a press release which | will send to you tomorrow.-

Thank icu.

cell:
email:

EFTA01140164



