
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: VI Gunite Pools 
Date: Mon, 05 Mar 2012 21:28:55 +0000 

Attachments: SICMBT_C25312030516510.pdf 

attached is a summary of all payments made per original and 2012 agreements 
total paid to VI Gunite was 392,416.99 

i am still compiling pool related expenses paid by LSJ but wanted you to have summary tonight 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-4811 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From:  
Date: March 5, 2012 3:51:45 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
Reply-To: 

EFTA01148235


