
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Rich Kahn <1 

Subject: Fwd: Re: 

Date: Tue, 17 Aug 2010 01:52:19 +0000 

Attachments: unnamed; unnamed(1) 

Inline-Images: bestlawyers.jpg; belc.gif; image.png; bcic 

is this right 

 Forwarded message -----
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Aug 16, 2010 at 7:50 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Re: 
To: Darren Indyke 

Is this right.? 

 Forwarded message 
From: Robert D. Critton Jr. <1 
Date: Mon, Aug 16, 2010 at 7:41 PM 
Subject: Re: Re: 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(ri)gmail.com>
Cc: "Robert Critton, Jr."  

I do not recall rich approving or disapproving any hall bill. Refer to my email re the procedure that you put in 
place and I followed re payments. Believe we pd halls and others w $$ you directed be wired for payment. But 
you ignored that cost and others for which bcic was responsible to the vendor contractually. So you left me 
no choice but to pay 

Sent from my iPhone 

BURMAN. CRITTON 
LUTTIER&.COLEMAN.ms 

  YOUR TRUSTED ADVOCATES 

Robert D Critton Jr. - Attorney at Law 

ach I FL 33401 

www bdclavi com 
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This e-mail contains legally privileged and confidential information intended only for the individual or entity 
named within the message. Should the intended recipient forward this message to another person or party, that 

EFTA01153765



action could constitute a waiver of the attorney/client privilege. If the reader of this message is not the intended 
recipient, or the agent responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, 
dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is prohibited. If this communications was received 
in error, please notify us by reply e-mail and delete the original message. 

Disclaimer added by CodeTwo Exchange Rules 
www.codetwo.com 

On Aug 16, 2010, at 7:23 PM, "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.corn> wrote: 

do I understand that halls last bill was not approved by rich? 

On Mon, Aug 16, 2010 at 4:45 PM, Robert D. Critton Jr. < > wrote: 

Preparing for mediation, am sending response in few mins. As per your direction, I reviewed 3d party bills including 
halls before I would send them to you. Found some mistakes /errors and asked that they revise and resend. I then sent 
to you, darren and rich for review and payment to bcic and I in turn paid halls when kahn would fund. That was the 
procedure. We sent halls bill over a month ago and rec'd no response, and sent an email on august 9th requesting a 
response by Tuesday at 5, I received nothing from je, darren, or jack. So I proceeded as I indicated I would. Your ?s 
are answered in the email to follow. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
includint all attachments. 
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