
From: "Rich Kahn" <MI > 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: 
Date: Fri, 11 Dec 2009 14:28:17 +0000 

Attachments: DPMG_Epstein_invoice_11-20-09.pdf 

Gary is referring to 43,365.20 for his and Steve's November pay 
Please advise 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

 Original Message 
From: Gary Kerney [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, December 11, 2009 6:09 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: 

Can you wire landmarks funds today?please advise. Gary 
Sent from my iPhone 

EFTA01154714


