
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Scott Denett 
Date: Tue, 28 Jan 2014 20:41:46 +0000 

Attachments: wvvw.macdoctomyc.com_Invoice_JE-1403-2025.pdf 

i spoke with scott - he said he would do 1800 cash for invoice below 
please advise if ok 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel  
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: bellaklein 
Subject: Fwd: Invoice 
Date: January 28, 2014 2:33:58 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: bellaklein 
Subject: Fwd: Invoice 
Date: January 16, 2014 4:38:14 PM EST 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com>

Jeffrey, 
Scott completed his project in PB and emailed invoice in the amount of $2000. He is charging for travel time 
to/from PB 4hrs - $340, but gives a discount of $295. Please advise. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Scott Denett < 
Subject: Invoice 
Date: January 16, 2014 3:34:38 PM EST 
To: bellaklein Klein < >, Bella Klein < 
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