From: Zorro Development _ =
To: Wendy Martinez </ -

Subject: Fwd: Thank you
Date: Fri, 25 Feb 2011 11:01:28 +0000

Attachments: Zorro Project approval form.pdf

Good Morming Wendy
Please confirm that you received this E Mail
Thanks

Begin forwarded message:

From: Zorro Ranch <] -
Date: February 20, 2011 3:50:46 PM AST
To: Wendy Martinez <[

Subject: Re: Thank vou

Good Afternoaon Wendy

Please forward invoices/statements when yvou can.

You will need to complete the attached Project Approval Form for the work complete on the Water Damage, as
this is over standard repairs and maintenance, attached all backup information

Thanks |}

On Sat, Feb 19, 2011 at 6:46 PM, Wendy Martinez a_f wrote:
]

Yes [ had tried the unplugeing idea and it didn't work so thanks for calling them.
[ understand the checks are for emergency purposes. | will have to try and get the invoices faxed or emailed
ASAP because payment 15 due at time of service. One invoice will be for shavings and the other two will be
for the faux painter who will do the finish work on the main house water damage.
I will send as soon as I get them
Thanks
Wendy
On Sat, Feb 19, 2011 at 2:06 PM, Zorro Ranch <] - o<
Hi Wendy,

Diirect TV Unit in Master - Authorization Expired, either means that the card needs updating or the unit
has been depowered for a period of time and needs to be rebooted, it usually is not a card issue as they are
farever sending E Muails etc when expiration date in near. The easiest way is to unplug the unit & TV for
about 5 minutes and re power, Since Direct TV could not do this and it was late when I was in contact with
them they rebooted the entire system, please make sure that this did not throw one of the other unit out.
Note this is for the Direct TV units only, do not do this for Dish Network units

Checks, as vou know the checks that vou hold are for emergency use, hence please get all vendors to
follow the standard pavment procedure, either, Mail, E Mail or give to vou and vou can scan
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statement/invoice to me to process pavment. Obviously if they take Wire Transfers even better
Thanks

On Fri, Feb 18, 2011 at 6:19 PM, Wendy Martinez — wrote:
Hi [
[ wanted to let you know that the tv in the master suite is working now. Thank vou for calling them.
Also, I was wondering if you could send some checks(2) to the Ranch as there will be a couple
of venders coming out and they only take checks. [ will let you know when they come and for how
much.
Thank you
Wendy

Zorro Development Corp
49 Zorro Ranch Road
Stanley, NM 87036
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