From: Bella Klein <] -

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=

Subject: Dr Magnani

Date: Thu, 26 Apr 2012 15:34:08 +0000
Attachments: SKMBT C25312042611110.pdf

Attached please find invoice from Dr Magnani for Inina in the amount of $400. She had a procedure on Apnl

18th. Please advise.
Thank vou

Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From:
Date: April 26, 2012 11:11:19 AM EDT
To:

Subject: Message from KMBT C253
Reply-To: N

EFTA01176466



