From: Bella Klein <] -
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Ce: Rich Kahn || -
Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN / Mercedes
Date: Fri, 01 Jun 2012 16:10:40 +0000
Attachments: DevisMercedesluinl 2. pdf; DevisMercedesMatJuin1 2MIJE pdf

WValdson took the car to the repair shop and received a new corrected quote for repair $13,313.12 Euros. It is an
increase of 4,174.42 Euros (3468.30 Euros plus tax) for an increased cost of a custom made part, as this1s a
special Mercedes model (custom made car was made before you purchased 1t ). Please advice if Valdson should
ro ahead with the repair.

Thank vou.
Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From: Marie-Joseph Experton <
Date: June 1, 2012 10:55:50 AM EDT
To: 'Bella Klein' < =
Cc: 'Rich Kahn' <
Subject: EPSTEIN / Mercedes
Reply-To:

Attachments.

From: Marie-Joseph Experton [mailto:

Sent: vendredi 1 juin 2012 16:52
To: 'Bella Klein'

Cc: 'Rich Kahn'

Subject: EPSTEIN [/ Mercedes

URGENT

New gquote received from MERCEDES (amounting to 13,313.12 € instead of 9,138.70 € due to increase of cost
of the major spare parts). Explanation from MERCEDES: the spare parts can be confirmed only when ordered,
and order can be placed only if down payment has been received. Valdson went this moming to pay with his

card 3,000 € and immediately after he received the corrected updated new guote. See marked-up copy attached
of the 2 quotes for full details.

Confirmation of order of the spare parts and repairs will start only when new quote 1s accepted. If accepted
today, the car should be ready by next Friday the earliest, or beginning of the week starting June 1 1t

Please advice.

Best regards.

EFTA01177310



Marie-Joseph Experton

Avacar au Barveau de Paris établi a Bruxellex

From: Bella Klein [mailto: | G

Sent: jeudi 31 mai 2012 19:09
To: _

Cc: Marie J Experton
Subject: Re: devis

I received JE approval for Mercedes repair!
Thank vou,
Bella

On May 31,2012, at 12:28 PM, [ -

valdson
=DOC310512-31052012164539 . pdf=

EFTAO01177311



