From: Allison Reddington *~m
To: Miltos Mouzakis || | G . Pccoy Sicgal ‘.—

CC:
"JEEVACATION@GMAIL.COM" <JEEVACATION (@ GMAIL.COM:=,

< o

'bryan bantry'
Subject: RE: Payment of services
Date: Thu, 02 Aug 2012 14:37:09 +0000
Attachments: Peggy Siegal Plane Payment.jpg
Inline-Images: image001 . gif; image002 jpe; image003.jpe

Dear Miltos,
Attached is Peggy’s credit card payment for the plane on Saturday.
Jeffrey- please reimburse Peggy.

Best,
Allison

From: Miltos Mouzakis [mailtF
Sent: Thursday, August 02, 2 :

To: Peggy Siegal

Cc: Allison Reddington; I

Subject: Payment of services

Hi Peggy, hi Allison

We are running short of time, and we still haven't seen any payment for the plane of Saturday 4th August from Dalaman
to Kos and the ground transportation

Can you please advise of status, or whether there has been a change in your plans , to see where are we standing?

If payment has already been done, then please send us the copy of the swift, as this will the only way to track if funds
have bean sent to our account.

We look forward to your kind reply.
Best regards

Miltos Mouzakis
Managing Fartner
Mobile +30.6982.333 444
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Magna Travel Ltd | 39 Ithomis 5t. | Glyfada | GR 16561
| Tel: 430.210.960.5555 | Fax: +30.210.960.2565 |
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Email: miltos@magna-aviation.com
wWww. magna-aviation.com

.. abldd

Member of BACA AND
Baltic Air Charter Association
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