From: bellaklein <[ -
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re:
Date: Thu, 12 May 2016 16:00:46 +0000
Attachments: Amex Black Thomas Magnam JE B00 050616.pdf

Bill for $800 charge attached, it was for March 7th and 30th visit. Working on 2015 bills.

Thank vou,
Bella

Tel:

On May 12, 2016, at 11:55 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationfagmail.com> wrote:

what is my 800 from when"?
On Thu, May 12, 2016 at 5:49 PM, bellaklein <_'-* wrote:
Attached please find charges explanation on May 9th. All charges are still pending, [ will watch what will be

actually posted. One charge of $830 15 pending twice. If it is posted twice, Dr. Magnani office will issue a
credit. Please advise if [ answered your question.

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:

On May 12, 2016, at 11:22 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(agmail.com> wrote:

check the centurion card on tues

On Thu, May 12, 2016 at 5:14 PM, bellaklein f—'-'-* wrote:

The charge of $2300 is on the attached invoice. The last charge for you was on March 30th. [ called Dr.
Magnani office, they don't have any $2400 for you with in the past month. Please advise.

Thank vou,
Bella
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Tel

On May 12, 2016, at 11:01 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com=> wrote:

[ was inquiring about the other day of 2400

On Thu, May 12, 2016 at 5:00 PM, bellaklein <|| G -  rote:

Attached please find 2 bills from Dr. Magnani for your dental procedures. In addition, attached please
find Dr Magnam charges for your assistants in 2016.

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:

On May 12, 2016, at 7:47 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

dental bills?
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