
From: Larry Visoski 

To: Rich Kahnalr>, Je vacation <jeevacation®gmail.com>, Carlos 
Rodriguez 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice 

Date: Wed, 09 Mar 2016 18:34:12 +0000 

Attachments: Nautica_RIB_Demolition_Estimate_Letter 03-09-16.doc; 
Nautica_RIB_Demolition_Estimate_03-09-16.xls; LSJ.pdf 

Deck removal 
Demolishing work scope from Zed on Nautica boat 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Zed Bennett <1 
Date: March 9, 2016 at 1:19:32 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: Invoice 

Please find attached the estimate letter, the estimate work sheet, & an invoice. Just let me know what you want 
to do. Thanks. 

Zed 

EFTA01186313


