
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: ' ' < 

Cc: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: JEGE Mx invoice 
Date: Tue, 04 Dec 2012 15:37:07 +0000 
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Yes 

On Tuesday, December 4, 2012, wrote: 
Jeffrey, 
May I have your approval to fwd to Rich Kahn in regards to JEGE maintenance Invoice? 
total is $22,403.61 
Main fuel supply line to engine, FMS Data loader, 02 leak in mask, these items where purchased Oct 5th, 2012. 

thank you, 
Larry 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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