
From: Richard Kahn < 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jecvacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Travis 
Date: Fri, 22 Feb 2013 15:09:22 +0000 

Attachments: SKMBT_C25313022117461.pdf 

> 

Attached is invoice in the amount of $200 for his last day of work which was Tuesday February 19th 
This is in addition to $1000 you approved for Feb 11-15th 
Please advise if ok to release 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor. 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From:  
Date: February 21, 2013 4:51:29 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
Reply-To: 

EFTA01188340


