
From: Richard Kahn

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Russell 

Date: Mon, 24 Nov 2014 17:45:14 +0000 

Attachments: Habibe_invoice_2414.docx 

please confirm ok to pay Bibe placement fee of 10,000 ($50,000 x 20%) 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Darren Indyke 
Subject: Fwd: Russell 
Date: November 22, 2014 at 7:49:02 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

ey, O,PRIFINIIm

************************ 

*********************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may 
be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, 
and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - O 2014 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: < 
Subject: RE: Russell 
Date: November 21, 2014 at 5:05:41 PM EST 
To: >, "'Darren Indyke"' < 

Hi Darren, Great speaking to you, Hopefully I will get to see you for a bit when I stop up ... Have a great weekend, 

Russell Katulak 
Jemstone Associates 
Partner 

New York, NY 10168 
Suite 1700 
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